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Lenczner Slaght Launches 
Commercial List Website!
 

Commerciallist.com is your one-stop shop for all things 
Commercial List.

Commercial litigation represents the heart of our practice at 
Lenczner Slaght. As a firm devoted exclusively to litigation, we 
have deep experience practicing on the Commercial List. In an 
effort to provide value to members of the Commercial List 
community, we have created commerciallist.com. This website 
includes existing practice resources, precedents, answers to 
frequently asked questions, best practices, interviews and 
blogs, important decisions, and relevant news and events.

The Commercial List website has no formal affiliation with the 
Court. However, Monique Jilesen, partner at Lenczner Slaght, 
is a member of the Commercial List Users’ Committee and led 
the firm’s team in the development of the website.

Monique says “As a specialized commercial court, the 
Commercial List is an invaluable resource to the business 
community for the efficient resolution of commercial disputes. 
We are proud to be launching commerciallist.com to provide 
access to practice resources and new ideas. It will be a great 
resource for the Court, counsel, and the public.”

Managing Partner of Lenczner Slaght, Tom Curry adds “The 
Commercial List is the Crown Jewel of the Canadian civil 
justice system and Lenczner Slaght is privileged to participate 
actively in its work. Our firm is also committed to innovation and 
continuous improvement; we believe that the launch of 
commerciallist.com is an important step forward for all who use 
this unique Court. We are excited about the chance to work 
with other participants to make the work of the Commercial List 
even better.”

If you have any questions, please visit our FAQ for more details 
or e-mail us at info@commerciallist.com.
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